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Introduction 
____________________________________ 

 

 
 
If you haven't heard about the latest in marketing, you may be 
interested to know that domain name marketing is a great way 
to get your business up and running. 
 
Every new business owner hope that when they start a web business 
and offer something that they know people will want may become very 
disappointed when they find out that people are not running to their 
store at all hours of the day to make a purchase. Why is that? 
 
They don t know your store even exists. You may have emailed a 
couple of friends or family regarding your new site, but you never 
thought that you would have to put in a lot of time advertising it. So 
where do you start 
 
A domain name is searchable with most search engine servers. 
 
If you are out there the search engines will find you but only if you add 
things to your site to make it searchable. Domain name marketing is a 
way to get your name out to the search engine servers and everyone 
you correspond with. They are all potential business leads, and you 
need each one of them. The ones that you figure won't purchase 
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Chapter 1: How To Use Domain 
Name Marketing 
____________________________________ 
 

 
 
A domain name is your way of being identified on the internet. 
 
The name that you choose will determine how many potential clients 
or customers you will have. 
 
You need to be very careful what name you select as it will be used to 
describe your business. Don t use a name that does not reflect on the 
products you sell or the service that you provide. 
 
Choosing a domain name is vital to any online business. When you use 
email marketing to attract your potential customers your domain name 
will be the name that the recipient will see. 
 
When you use domain name marketing to increase your business 
income you will need to spend a little extra time determining what 
group of people you will want to reach the most. 
 
If you have a product for teens, you don t necessarily need to sell it to 
adults. You need to know how to grab their attention. 


